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From: (b)(6) Mr CIV USAF USCENTCOM CCHC/F Command. See FOIA
Sent: Wednesday, February 02, 2011 2:38 PM Case #11-0131.

To: (b)(6) CIV USAF SAF/FMBIX

Cc: (b)(6) Capt MIL USAF USCENTCOM CCJ8/FMB; (b)(6)
1LT MIL USA USCENTCOM CCJ8/FMB; (b)(6) Mr CIV USAF
USCENTCOM CCHC/A; (b)(6) Civ USAF AFMC OO-ALC/GHSBD'
Subject: FW: Cost Breakdown for UPS repairs

Attachments: FSBU-11-P-035.pdf

Cost is now pegged at $57,202.05 (see attached).

PCCIE does not place surcharge on their service - | wish they did, then maybe
the AF would not be reducing their manpower by 50% and we would not be losing
their GREAT service next year.

(b)(6)
, Civ, DAF
Chief of Facilities (CCHC-FO)
Headquarters' Commandant
US Central Command
7115 South Boundary Blvd
MacDill AFB, FL 33621-5101

(b)(6)
_____ 0 -
From: (b)(®) Civ USAF AFMC OO-ALC/GHSBD
(b)(6)
13 PM
To: (b)(6) Mr CIV USAF USCENTCOM CCHC/F
Cc: (b)(6) CTR USCENTCOM CCHC/F

Subject: RE: Cost Breakdown for UPS repairs
Here you go...

----- Original Message-----

From: (b)(6) Mr CIV USAF USCENTCOM CCHC/F
(b)(6)
11:58 AM
To: (b)(6) Civ USAF AFMC OO-ALC/GHSBD
Cc: (b)(®) CTR USCENTCOM CCHC/F

Subject: Cost Breakdown for UPS repairs
Importance: High

(b)6), can you please press Eaton for a cost breakdown of the repairs.

I also need you to include any PCCIE fees.

SAF/FM is looking for 3080 funds for us now.

Our Contracting requires a SOW and cost estimate to go with the MIPR we will

send you. They won't accept a single lump sum line item.
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Thanks

(b)(6)

Chief of Facilities (CCHC-FO)
Headquarters' Commandant
US Central Command

7115 South Boundary Blvd

MacDill AFB, FL 33621-5101

(b)(6)
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